Finance and Business Operations Division
Procurement and Contracts Services Section
Department of Executive Services

CNK-ES-0340 206-263-9400 Ph
3 Floor 206-296-7676 Fax
KingCounty 51 50 avenue TTY Relay: 771

SEATTLE, WA 98104

SHIP TO: -

KC DES FBOD PCSS GOODS AND SERVICES
401 5TH AVE, CNR-ES-0340

SEATTLE, WA 98104

PRO-TOW
23933 SE 264TH STE B

MAPLE VALLEY, WA 98038 United States
Fax: {) 41310951

BiL TQ:

XC DES FBOD ACCOUNTS PAYABLES
401 5TH AVE, CNK-ES-0320
SEATTLE, WA 98104

CONTRACT

CONTRACT HNO. REVISION PAGE
5453903 0| 1of2

CREATION DATE BUYER
05-JUN-2012 PATRICIA REID

DATE OF REVISION BUYER

HCONTRACTORINO; HPAYMENT-TERMS:!

HEQBI i LSHIPAIANES

15560 NET30DAYS

DESTINATION Seller Chooses

“Telephone: ()

Contract Purchase Agreement

Furnish On-Call Towing Services as requested by
King County andfor Sound Transit personnel during
the period June 5, 2012 through June 4, 2017,

in accordance with ITB#1044-12, and the responding
bld from Pro-Tow, both incorporated by

reference as if fully set forth herein.

Awarded Areas:

Area 5 Seconary
Area 6 Secondary

Individual Standard Purchase orders
with unique Purchase QOrder numbers
referencing this contract purchase
agreement will be issued by King
County to authorlze the purchase

nd payment of goods and services.

All invoices must reference the Individual
Standard Purchase Order Number to avoid detay
in payments.

Estimated annuaf contract value $20,000.00.

DESCRIPTION

Q‘Iﬂ s

Authorlzed Signature




Finance and Business Operations Division =~ CONTRACTOR: .
Procurement and Contracts Services Section PRO-TOW CONTRACT
Department of Executive Services 23933 SE 264TH STE B
CONTRACT NO. PAGE

CNK-ES-0348. 206-263-9400 Ph MAPLE VALLEY, WA 98038 United States 5453903 m
KinaC 3" Floor 206-296-7676 Fax Pax: () 4131091

ingCounty o1 51 avenue TTY Ralay: 771 :
SEATTLE, WA 98104

SHIP TO: BILL TO: CREATION DATE BUYER
KC DES FEOD PCSS GOODS AND SERVICES KC DES FBOD ACCOUNTS PAYABLES 05-JUN-2012 PATRICIA REID
401 5TH AVE, CNK-ES-0340 401 5TH AVE, CNK-ES-0320

SEATTLE, WA 98104 SEATTLE, WA 98104 DATE OF REVISION | BOYER




ki
King County

Finance and

Business Operations Division
Procurement and Contract Services Section
Department of Executive Services

CNK-ES-0340
401 Fifth Avenue, 3™ floor
Seattle, WA 98104-1818

206-263-9400
206-296-7676 Fax
TTY Relay: 711

www. kingcounty.gov

May 21. 2012

RE: King County ITB#1144-12-PLR On-(all Towing Services

Thank you for submitting a proposal for the above referenced King County Invitation to Bid.
This is notice your firm has been selected as one of the apparent successful bidders by

area.

Area 1 North West King County
Lincoln Towing

Area 2 North Central King County
Lincoln Towing

Area 3 North East King County
Skyway Towing and Recovery
Lincoln Towing

Area 4 South East Central King County
Fitz Towing
Skyway Towing and Recovery

-Area 5 South East King County
Fitz Towing
Pro-Tow

Area 6 South West King County
Fitz Towing
Pro-Tow

Area 7 Central King County
Skyway Towing and Recovery
Airport Towing

Area 8 Vashon Island

$1,109.25
$1,5686.25

$1,336.05
$1,586.25

$821.00
$971.55

$797.00
$1,069.66

$797.00
$1,069.66

$971.55
$1,035.00

Primary
Secondary

Primary
Secondary

Primary
Secondary

Primary
Secondary

Primary
Secondary



Airport Towing $1,915.00 (includes ferry fees)

This selection and final award is conditioned upen your compliance with applicable State
and County laws, the terms and conditions specified in the ITB document, and your
response.

Again, thank you for your participation in this solicitation.

Sincerely,

Patty Reid, CPPB

King County Procurement and Contract Services
206-263-9304 phone

206-296-7676 fax



i
King County
Finance and
Business Operations Division
Procurement and Contract Services Section
Depariment of Executive Services
CNK-ES-0340

401 Fifth Avenue, 3™ floor
Seattle, WA 98104-1818

206-263-9400
206-296-7676 Fax
TTY Relay: 711

www. kinacoun ov

May 21. 2012

RE: King County ITB#1144-12-PLR On-Dall Towing Services

Thank yoﬁ for submitting a proposal for the above referenced King County Invitation to Bid.
This is notice your firm has been selected as one of the apparent successful bidders by

area.

Area 1 North West King County
Lincoln Towing

Area 2 North Central King County
Lincoln Towing

Area 3 North East King County
Skyway Towing and Recovery
Lincoln Towing

Area 4 South East Central King County
Fitz Towing
Skyway Towing and Recovery

.Area 5 South East King County
Fitz Towing
~ Pro-Tow

Area 6 South West King County
Fitz Towing
Pro-Tow

Area 7 Central King County
Skyway Towing and Recovery
Airport Towing

Area 8 Vashon Island

$1,109.25

$1,586.25

$1,336.05
$1,586.25

$821.00
$971.55

$797.00
$1,069.66

$797.00
$1,069.66

$971.556
$1,035.00

Primary
Secondary

Primary
Secondary

Primary
Secondary

Primary
Secondary

Primary
Secondary



Airport Towing ' $1,915.00 (includes ferry fees)

This selection and final award is conditioned upon your compliance with applicable State
and County laws, the terms and conditions specified in the ITB document, and your
response. '

Again, thank you for your participation in this solicitation.

Sincerely,

Patty Reid, CPPB

King County Procurement and Contract Services
206-263-9304 phone

206-296-7676 fax




" |Fitz Towing

Lincoln Towing Entarpe

S Towing & Recovery

" |FERRY FEES

FERRY FEES

Est. Uom Pro-Tow 420
Qty 2416 E. Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. H Strest NW  Aubum, WA |2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA
’ Aubum, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 98001 - 98057
Hem A DESCRIPTION Unit Price Unit Price Unit Prica  Unit Price
Area Eight T T,
VASHON ISLAND Each NO BID
Description Est. uom ] L
1 [Service Call . 1 | Per Service Call (Flat Rate -3 461.00 | § , 279951 3% 250.00
} L _|Onk) : . ) :
2 |Flat Bed Tow Call 1 | Per Tow (Flat Rata QOnly} $ 461.00 | §. 29995 % 400.00
2a L|ghl Tow gross weight rating of not 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ ) 461.00 | $ , '299.95 $ 400.00
) more than 10,000 pounds .
2b |Medium Tow gross weight rating of 1} {Fat Rate Only) Per Tow -3 564001 % 32995 | % 450.00
more than 10,000 pounds but nol :
more than 26,000 N }
2¢ |HeavyTow gross weight lahng of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow- 5 76400 | $ 399,95 | § 600.00
" |more than 26.000 ) ' . -
3 Stand-by Time I ] Per $ Lo 97.00 | & 3500 | $ 40.00
4a |Winching wilight Truck 1% ___Per $ : 97.00 | 3 3500 (3 40.00
. . fifteen minute intervals .
4b |Winching w/Medium Truck $_ Per k] 12100 | § 4000 $ 45.00
E - . fifteen minute intervals . .
“4c. |Winching wHeavy Class C Truck |5 . Per $ 121.00 | $ 5000 | $ 50.00
- e ‘ fifteen minute intervals
© 5 |Drive Lil_'le Removal 1 |Per vehicle 3 . 121003 8 . W95 |3 40.00
. & |Dolly Rental 1 | Per Tow Job $ 25.00 | N/C $ 40.00
7 M'Ieage Fee ] ) 1 ° | Per Mile § 475 |8 495§ 4.50
8 '[Bidders state Ihe number of bcensed No, of Trucks: No. of Trucks; 40 No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: 15
Towrng Trucl( available to perform 15 : 10 ’
sennoe-s in Area Eight )
g B:dders shall list their firns Street Fitz Towing Lincoln Towing Enterprise Pro-Tow 420 |Skyway Towing & Recovery
Address. and/or eqmpmenl stations for} 2416 E, Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. H Street NW  Aubum, WA 2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA )
: Araa Eight - - Aubum, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 98001 ’ 98057
| Area Eight Totals NO BID $3,301.75 $1,809.85 ] $2,359.50
' DOES NOT INCLUDE DOES NOT INCLUDE_ [DOES NOT INCLUDE FERRY [—[ﬁ}U

FEES

-




Llncoln owing Enterpse

Skywy Towin & Recovery '

Fitz Towing Pro-Tow 420
2416 E. Strest NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. H Street NW  Aubum, WA |2960E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA
Aubum, WA 938002 Seattle, WA 98133 98001 98057
Est. uom
Qty ) B e .
DESCRIPTION Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price - Unit Priceé
Area Seven
: Cehtral ~'King County
Iten -Description Est. uoMm NO BID
No. - 1 aty . . ,
1 |Service Call 1 | Per Sepvice Call (Flat Rate $101.00] 124.95 125.00
Only)

2__|Flat Bed Tew Call 1 | Per Tow (Flat Rate Only) $121.00 184.95 150.00

2a |Light 'l‘,ow gross weight rating of not 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $101.00 184.95 135.00
jmore than 10,000 pounds .

2b "Medium Tow gross weighit rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $423.00 209.95[ 160.00

|rmiore than 10,000 pounds but not . :
more Ihan 26 000 . 7

2c | Hea\.-y Tow gross welght rahng of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $523.00 279,95 250.00

|more than 26.000 - . )

3 |Stand-by Time’ T |$ _ Per $27.50 35.00 40.00

: o . .__|fifteen minvte inlervals T -
4a [Winching wiLight Truck 1 1% Per $27.50 35.00 40,00
N ) ’ fifleén minute intervals
4b [Winching wiMedium Truck 3 - Per $49.50 40.00 45.00

e - :[fifteen minute intervals ] -

4c |Winching w/Heavy Class C Truck $ : . Per $49.50 50.00 50.00

’ s N fifteen minute intervals '

5 |Drive Line Removal ) 1 |Per vehicle $49.50 3495 40.00

| & {Doy Reniar 1 [ Per Tow Job $20.00[N/C 46.00

7 M‘leage Fee 1 | PerMile $4.75 4,95 4.50

8 [Bidders state- the number of licensed - No. of Trucks: No, of Trucks: 40 No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: 10

| Towing Truck avaitable (o pelform 15 : : 10
sennoes in Area Seven . .

9 Bldders sha list thetr firms Streat Fitz Towing Lincoln Towing Enterprise  |Pro-Tow 420|Skyway Towing & Recovery
Address andfor equ:pment stations for '|2416 E. Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. H Street NW Auburn, WA [2560 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA
Area Seven Auburn, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 98001 . |es0s7 .

Area Seven NO BID ' $1,506.25 $1,184.65 $1,079.50
Prompt payment terms
v prompt payment discount
GRAND TOTAL




AWARD #2

iLincoln Towing Enterprise Pro-Tow ) Skyway Towing & Recovery Alrport Towing 817
12220 Aurora Ave N. 23933 SE 264th St 2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA SW 145th St Burien,
Seattle, WA 98133 - |Maple Valley, WA 98038  [98057 : WA
ARFA SIX
Southwest - King Gounty Unit Price Uit Price . Unit Price Unit Price
Mem Description Est uom
No. Qty i
1 |Servica Call 1 | Per Service Call {Flat Rate 3 101.00 | $ 99958 150.00 | $ 125.00
. . Only)- . . . .
2 IFlat Bed Tow Call 1} Per Tow (Flat Rate Only} HES 121.00 | 159,95 | $ 200001 % 150.006
2a '|Light Tow gross weight rating of not 1 | {Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ “101.00 | §° 159.95 | § 175.00 | $ 150.00
more than 10,000 pounds .
-2b |Medium Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Rat Rate Only) Per Tow 5 423001 % 199.95 | 3 20000 | $ 250.00
more than 10,000 pounds but not
more than 26,000
2¢c |Heavy Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow E 52300 |5 249.95 | § 300.00 | & 300.00
. |more than 26,000 - ) .-
-3 |Stand-by Time 1 |$___ -_Per $ 27.50 | § 3500)% 4000 | % 30.00
’ L ) fifteen minute intervals X : )
4 |Winchirig wiLight Truck 1 % - Per s 2750\ % 35004 % 40003 40.00
fifteen minule intervals s T
4a - Winching w/ Medium Truck T |$ . Per X% 4950 | § 4000 | % 4500 | $ 50.00
- o ’ _ fifteen minute intervals - . ’ )
4b |Winching wf Heavy Class C Truck 1|8 R Per $ 4950 | % 50.00 | $ 50.00 | 8 60.00
E - ’ . fifteen minute intervals ! 7 - i
5 |Diive Line Removal 1 |Per vehicle HE 4950 | 3495 | % 40001 % 40.00
6. |Doly Rental 1 | Per TowJob |8 2900 | § - $ 40.00 | § 40.00
- ¥ {Mileage Fee 1 | Per Mile $ 475 | $ 4.95 450|% 5.00
& |Bidders state the number of licensed No. of Trucks:, A0 No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: 10 No. of Trucks:
Towing Truck available to perform . k[ 12
services in Area Six -
9 |Bidders shall list their firms Street ] Lincoln Towing Enterprise  |Pro-Tow Skyway Towing & Recovery Airport Towing 817
Address and/or equipment stations for 2220 Aurora Ave N. 23933 SE 264th 5t 2860 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA S5W 149th St Buren,
Area Six Seattle, WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA 98038 (93057 ' - WA
’ Area Six Totals 01 $ 1,683.75 | § 1,069.65 | $ 1,284.50 | $ 1,240.00




Lincoln Towing Enterprise
12220 Aurora Ave N. -
Seatile, WA 98133

23933 SE 264th St
Maple Valley, WA 93038

S Towing & Recw.-

2960 E Valley Rd. Renton, WA

98057 :

1s 1,606.25

AREA FIVE .. .
South East - King County ) . Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price -
item Description Est | -UOoMm
No. Qty N i
1 |Service Call 1 | Per Service Call (Flat Rate - | 9995
) : |Only) i .
2  |Flat Bed Tuw Call 1 | Per Tow {Flat Rale Only) 2100 % | 15995 | $ E 200.00
2a |Light Tow-gross weightratingofnet |- 1 | (Rlat Rate Only) Per Tow 101.00 1 § - 15995 | % : 175.00
. |more than 10,000 pounds ~ -+ - o : _ )
2b [Medium Tow gross weight rating of |- 1 | (FTat Rafe Only) Per Tow 42300 | $ 198951 % . 200,00
"-|more than 10,000 pounds but not S . :
more than 26,000 : - : : i .
2¢; [Heavy Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow 523.00 | $ 24995 | $ . 300.00
‘| more than 26,008 B A :
3 |[Stand-by 'ﬁmg . 1 1% .. 7 " per 2750 | § 3500 | % 40.00
e 0T " - |RReen minute intervals S
.4 |Winching wflight Truck 1 1% - Per 2750 | $-- 35.00 | $ - 40.00
' C ’ " |fifteen miniute intervals ’ '
4a |Winching w/ Medium Truck 118 - Per 4950 | § ' 4000 | % 45.00
.- fifteen minute intervals :
4b {Winching w/ Heavy Class C Truck i % _Per 4950 | 8 50.00 [ $ 50.00
RN R ’ fifteen minute intervals ) 7
5 - 1Drive Line Remaval 1 |Pervehicle 49.50 | § 34951 % 40000 |
& .'|Dolly Rental 1 - | Per Tow Job 2500 |%- - $ 40.00
7 |Mileage Fee- .- 1 | PerMile . ) 475 | % 495 | % 4.50
8 |Bidders stale the number of licensed - No. of Trucks 40 MNo. of Trucks; No. of Trucks:, 10
Towing Tiuck available to perfo 10
services in Area Five )
9 {Bidders shall list their firms Street iLincoln Towing Enterprise * [Pro-Tow Skyway Towlng & Recovery
Address andfog equipment stations for 2220 Aurara Ave N. 23933 5E 264th 5t ) 2960 E. Valley Rd, Renton, WA
Area Five . : Seatile, WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA 93038  |93057 -
Area 5 totals $ 1,060.65 | § 1,284.50 NO BID

AWARD #2




Lincoln Towing Enterprise

Skyway Towing & Recovery

Pro-Tow Alrport Towing 817
12220 Aurora Ave N. 23933 SE 264th St 2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA SW 145th St Burien,
Seattle, WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA 98038. [98057 = - - WA '
AREA FOUR
South East Central - King Gounty ]
| Hem Description Est. uoM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No. Oty - .
1 |Service Call - 1 | Per Service Call (Flat Rale $ 101.00 | $ 12495 % . 125.00 |NC BID
) : Only)
2 |Flat Bed Tow Call "~ 1 | Per Tow (Flat Rate Only) |- 12100 | § 184951 % 150.00
2a . |Light Tow gross weight rating ofnot  {. 1 [ (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow EE] 101.00 | §. 184.95 | $ 135.00
Jmiore than 10,000 pounds
2b" |Medium Tow gross weight rating of 1 [ (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow 5 42300 | § ’ 20995|% 160.00
. |more than 10,000 pounds but not - .
more than 26,000 ] o
" 2¢ {Heavy Tow gross weight rating of .1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow - RE 573.001% : T 27985 | % 250.00
. more than 26,000 . :
3 |Stand-by Time 1 1% = Per ik} 2780 | & 3500 | § . 40.00
-4 |Winching wilight Truck EE Per s 27.50 [ 35008 40,00
: : fifteen Vminuttre intervals
. 4a |Winching w/ Medium Truck 1 % - _ Per | $ 4950 | $ 4000 | & : 45.00
. fifteen minute intervals . : )
4b _|Winching'w/ Heavy Class C Truck 18 __Per 49,50 [ $ Y. . . soools : 50.00
o - . fifléen minute intervals . ' : '
5. |Drive Line Remov-al 1 [|Pervehicle - $ 49._50 ¥ i 349513 40.00
& |Doly Rental. 1| Per Tow Job 3 25.00 NC|$ 40,00
7 |Mieage Fee T |Per Mils s aT5(s 495 $ 450
"8 |Bidders stale the number of ficensed No. of Trucks No. of Trucks: [No. of Trucks: 10 [No.of Trucks:
Towing Truck avallable to perform 40 10 ’ 12
services in Area Four . e .
9 |Bidders shak list their firms Street - E Lincoln Towing Enterprise  |Pro-Tow . 420|Skyway Towing & Recovery Alrport Towing 817
Address and/or equipment stations for, 2220 Aurora Ave N H Street NW Aubum, WA [2960 E. Va_lley_ Rd. Renton, WA SW 145th St- Burien,
Area Four Seattle, WA 98133 98001 98057 : WA
. Area 4 totals Ik 1,566.25 | § 1,184.65 | § - ] 1,079.50 NOBID
Prompt payment terms
prompt payment discount
GRAND TOTAL




itz Towing Lincoln Towing Enterprise Alrport wmg 817
2416 E. Street NE -[12220 Aurora Ave N. |SW 148th St  Burien,
‘ o Auburn, WA 98002 Seaﬂ]e. WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA_ 98038 WA
. AREA THREE
North East - King County )
Hem Description Est. uom Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price | “Unit Price Unit Price
No. . Qty il .
1 |Service Call 1 | Per Servics Call (Flat Rate  |NO BID $ 10100 | & . 279.95 ‘|NO BID
' Only) CEEE
2 |Fiat Bed Tow Call 1 | Per Tow (Flat Rate Only) $ 12100 | $ 299,95 |
2a |Light Tow gross weight rating of not 1 | (Flat Rate Only} Per Tow $ . 101.00 | § 299.95 |-
qm_qra_lhgn 10,_000 poundg i ) .
2b -|Medium Tow gross weight rating of. 1 | {Fat Rate Only) Per Tow 1s . . 423.00 |- ’ 329,95
*|more than 10,000 pounds but not T : N ) : :
' - }more than 25,000 .
2c |Heavy Tow gross weight rating of 1 ! (Rat Rate Only) Pes Tow . $ 57300 | 8 ) 39995 |-
___|more than 26,060 - - : N : : N :
3 - |Stand-by Time .. - 1 [$__ Per $ 57.50 | $ 3500 1§ . -
. fifleen minute intervals B e T
4 . IWinching wilight Truck 1,195 Per $ 2750|180 . 35.00 |-%
- ’ " |fteen-minute intervals '
4a - [Winching w/ Medium Truck 1% - - Per $ . 4950 ( $ - 40.00 g
) fifteen minute intervals
4b Winching w/ Heavy Class C Truck 115 i i Per $ 4950 | 5 50.60
B o fifteen minute intervals : )
5 |Drive Line Remaval - 1 |Per vehide - .5 49.50 | 5 ) 34,95
_ 6 |Doity Rentai ~ o 1 { Per Tow Job H -29.00 | NIC
7 |Mileage Fee 1 | Per Mile' $ ) 475 $ 4.95
- 8. |Bidders state the number of licensed No. of Trucks: " INo. of Trucks:__ 40 __ [No. of Trucks:
Towing Tiuck available to perform 15 10
- |services in Area Three .
9 . |Bidders shall list their firms Street Fitz Towing Lincoln Towing Enterprise Pro-Tow
Address and/or equipment stations for| 2416 E. Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N, - 23933 SE 264th St
Area Three. T B Auburn, WA 98002 - |Seattle, WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA 98038
’ Area 3 totals NOEID $ 1,588.25 | § 1,814.60
! Prompt payment terms
" | prompt payment discount
GRAND TOTAL _
AWARD #2

AWARD ¥

S Tttt teter - e e




Fitz Towii:g Pro-Tow Skyway Towing & Recovery Ajrport Towing 817
2416 E, Street NE (123933 SE 264th S5t 2350 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA SW 149th St Burien,
Aubum, WA 98002 :|Maple Valley, WA 98038 ~|9B057 . WA
AREA TWO
North Central - King County .
Hem Description [Est. UOM Unit Price. - Unit Price - Unit Price Unif Price
No. . . Gty . L . . .
© 1 |Servica Call 1 | Per Service Call (FlatRate |NO BID NG BID $ 175.00 [NO BID
) ) . Only) - . - :
. 2 |FlatBed TowCall -1 | Per Tow (Flat Rate Only) H 200.00
2a |Light Tow gross weight rating of not 1 { (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow- $ 175.00
mare than 10,000 pounds '
2b - |Medium Tow gross weight rating of 1 | {Flat Rate Only) Per-Tow $ 225,00
’ more than 10,000 pounds but not .
more than 26,000 . '
2c"{Heavy Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ 325.00
mofe than 26,000 . - . .
3 |Stand-by Time ’ 1 [$ Per 3 40.00
o . fifteen minute intervals
4 - |Winching wilight Truck 1 |1$5__ - _Per $ 40.00
’ ' - fifteen minute intervals : ’ '
-4a. |Winching w/ Medium Truck 1 1% _~_~__Perfifteen 5 45.00
- L ' T minute inlervals ’
ab_ |Wiriching w/ Heavy Class G Truck Y Per fitzen s . 50.00
- minute intervals
5 |Drive Line Removal - 1 |Per vehicle $ 40.00
6 Dolly Renta! | E ) 1 | Per Tow Job $ 40.00
Mileage Fee 1 | Per Mile $ 4.50
8_ |Bidders state the number of licensed No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: 10 No. of Trucks:
©* |Towing Trunk available to perform - 15 10° 12
servicesinAreaTwo .~ . : .
9. |Bidders shall list thelr firms Street Fitz Towing Pro-Tow Skyway Towing & Recovery Alrport Towing 817
' Address andfor gquipr_nen: stations for 2416 E. Street NE (23933 SE 264th St - [2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA {SW 149th St Burlen,
- tArea Two E . Auburmn, WA 98002 - Maple Valley, WA 98038  |98057 WA -
. Area 2 tofals NOBID NO EID s _ 1,359.50 NO BID
- . Non-responsive - cannot respond
AWARD within 30 minutes




1044-12-PL-R Towing Services

Area 1 totals

Fltz Towing L]nci?lh'Toyyipgiﬁht'erﬁﬁse;' -|Pro-Tow Skyway Towing & Recovery i Alrport Towing 817
2446 E. Street NE 12220 Aumga‘ﬁife,N. : ... 123933 SE 264th St 2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA SW149th St Burien,
Aubum, WA 958002 Seattle, WA 98133 ~ . ‘ |Maple Valley, WA 98038 98057 WA
AREA ONE e -
Northwest - King County
Item Description Est uom “|Unit Price Unit Price . Unit Price Unft Price
No.
1 |Sepvice Calt 1 ] Per Service Call (Flat Rate NC BID NO BID $ - 175.00 |NO BID
- Only)
2 |Flat Bed Tow Call 1 | Per Tow (Flat Rate Only) $ . ) T 22500
-2a |Light Tow gross weight rating of not 1 | (Fiat Rate Only) Per Tm;v $ - - 200.00
more than 10,000 pounds
2b Medium Tow gross.weight rating.of - 1 | {Flat Rate Cnly) Per Tow 3 250.00
more than 10,000 pounds but not . .
more than 26,000 )
-2c |Heavy Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ - 350.00
.|more than 26,000 ' ’ .
3 |Stand-by Time LI Per ~. $ 40.00
fifleen minute intervals . -
4 _ Iwinching wf Light Truck 1 (% : Per $ 40.00
fifteen minute intervals
4a {Winching w/ Medium Truck 1 (% . Per $ 45.00
‘ fifiéen minute intervals ’
4b JWinching w/ Heavy Class C Truck 148 _ ) Per $ 50.00
. fifteen minute intervals
5 |Drivé Line Removal 1 |Pervehide s 2000
€ |Dolly Rental 1 .| Per Tow Job $ 2000
"7 |Mileage Fee 1| Per Mile 3 450
8 |Bidders state the number of licensed No. of Trucks: x|No.of Trucks: - 10 - [No. of Trucks; 10 No. of Trucks:
[ Towing Truck available’to perform 15 12
-|services in Area One - ) . . ] )
9- |Bidders shall list their firms Street Fitz Towing Ll 3| Pro-Tow Skyway Towing & Recovery . Alrport Towing 817
Address and/or equipment stations for, 2416 E. Street NE 13 23933 SE 264th 5t 2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA SW 149th St Burien,
Area One Auburn, WA 98002 aple \{al_ley, WA 28038 98057 s WA
NO BID NO BID H 1,459,560 NO BID

© AWARD

Non-responsive - cannot respond

within 30 minutes -






